
 

 

 

 

 

 
October 2018  
 
 
Freedom of Information Request Reference No: FOI 003541/18 
 
I write in connection with your request for information received by Norfolk Constabulary on the 28th 
September 2018 in which you sought access to the following information: 
 

1 The cost of policing each Norwich City home game (broken down club-by-club) 
during the 2017- 2018 season.  

2 The number of officers deployed to each Norwich City home game (broken down 
club-by-club) during the 2017-2018 season, broken down by policing rank. 

3 The number of arrests made at each Norwich City home game (broken down club-
by-club) during the 2017-2018 season, broken down by type of offence. 

 
Response to your Request 
 
The response provided below is correct as of 5th October 2018. 
 
Norfolk Constabulary has located the following information as relevant to your request. 
 
Q1 The Constabulary does not record the costs for each individual match played at Norwich 

City football ground.  Each match is assessed depending on intelligence and information 
held.  It is then categorised with regard to the policing and agreed with the club.  This can 
range from no policing requirement to a significant number of officers being required.  This 
is not finalised until 2-3 weeks before each match.  Many factors are taken into 
consideration, for example, the league position, the competition position, away supporter 
behaviour and the likelihood of promotion or relegation.  The timings and days of the 
matches also impact on the match category.     

 
The timings and days of the matches will also impact on the match category. 

 
The only identifiable costs would be those relating to officer overtime, transport and 
subsistence but these are not coded for specific matches.  Full costs of policing inside and 
outside of the grounds are not recorded.  There will be additional duties carried out on 
match days which will not be specifically identified as football duties and are therefore not 
reflected in any costs.   

 
The match between Norwich City and Ipswich Town, on 18th February, had a specific cost 
code for the recording of overtime, mutual aid, etc.   

 
The additional costs for this match were £29,209.   
The amount charged to the club was £28,559. 

 
Although not match specific, details of the costs of policing Norwich City football matches 
has previously been released and have been provided below:- 
  

Season Figure charged to Norwich City Football Club 

2017/18 £187,954 

 



Q2 The number of officers assigned to each match has not been provided due to exemptions 
within the Act.  Section 1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA) placed two duties 
on public authorities.  Unless exemptions apply, the first duty at section 1(1)(a) is to confirm 
or deny whether the information specified in a request is held.  The second duty at section 
1(1)(b) is to disclose information that has been confirmed as being held. 

 
 Section 17 of the Freedom of Information Act requires that the Constabulary, when refusing 

to provide information that has been confirmed as held (because the information is 
exempt), is to provide you, the applicant, with a notice ban which:- 

 
(a) States that fact 
(b) Specifies the exemption(s) in question and 
(c) States (if that would not otherwise be apparent) why the exemption applies. 

 
The information is exempt from disclosure by virtue of the following exemption:- 
 

 Section 31(1)(a)(b) – Law Enforcement 
 
Section 31 is a qualified prejudice based exemption and I am therefore obliged to articulate 
the harm in this information being disclosed and assess the public interest in disclosure.  

 

Harm in disclosure 

Disclosure of information under the Freedom of Information Act is considered to be a 
release of information to the world as a whole, because once released, it will published on 
the disclosure log pages of the Constabulary’s website.  Whilst not questioning an 
applicant’s motives for requesting information, careful consideration has to be given to any 
release.  Information regarding the number of officers deployed to individual matches would 
be of interest to individuals who attend football games intending to commit offences and 
disrupt matches.    

 
As advised above, officer attendance and numbers are based on match categories taking 
into account previous match history and current intelligence.  Providing the officer numbers 
would allow individuals to gauge future matches where officer numbers are likely to be at 
their lowest. Although it could be considered that the information requested is historical and 
will vary each year, providing the figures would give a reasonable indication of policing 
numbers. 

 
The numbers will be subject to change depending on operational requirement; however it 
would provide a good basis for an approximate value to be determined. This would be 
useful information to those planning to commit offences and would therefore undermine the 
law enforcement capabilities of the Constabulary.  

 

Factors favouring disclosure 

Providing the requested information would demonstrate openness and transparency which 
are fundamental principles of the Freedom of Information Act.  Public safety is of 
paramount importance.  Disclosing the numbers would demonstrate that the Constabulary 
is appropriately allocating increased resources to matches where the risk of offences being 
committed is believed to be greater and thereby ensuring the safety of supporters. 
 
Factors favouring non-disclosure 
Providing the requested information would allow individuals to gauge the number of officers 
on duty at future games.  Any advanced knowledge would assist those involved in criminal 
activity to plan their activities around matches where the numbers of officers are perceived 
as likely to be lower.   

 



Additional resources would be required around the planning and frontline officers in order to 
counter any increased offending.   

 

Balancing test  
There is a public interest in the use of police resources and considerable planning goes into 
assessing matches, to determine whether there is a requirement for officers to be in 
attendance.  Providing the officer numbers would reassure the public that appropriate 
consideration is given to ensure their safety when attending games.  However, information 
that could also be beneficial to those involved in criminal activity should not be released 
under the Freedom of Information Act. 

 
It would not be in the public interest to disclose any information which would be of interest 
and assistance to individuals who commit or plan to commit crime.  This would undermine 
the Constabulary’s law enforcement function and would result in the need for additional 
planning and resources.   
 
For the above reasons, at this moment in time, the balance lies in non-disclosure of the 
requested information by virtue of the exemption at section 31, law enforcement.  

 
Q3 Please see below details of arrests that have been made at Norwich City home matches:- 
 

Date Match 
Number of 

Arrests 
Reason for arrest 

18/02/2018 Ipswich Town 10 

5 x Criminal Damage 
3 x Section 5 Public Order Act 

1 x Possession of Alcohol in Designated 
Sports Ground in view of playing area 

1 x Drunk & Disorderly 

06/03/2018 
Nottingham 

Forest 
1 Pitch Encroachment 

14/04/2018 Cardiff City 2 
Possession of Controlled Substance 

Drunk & Disorderly 

 
 


